

BIDDER:	19th Ave Substation	7th Ave Substation	6th & Lowry Island	6th & Washington Island	8th & Husband Parking Lot	9th & Husband Parking Lot	9th & Lewis Parking Lot	Armory Recreation Center	Boomer/Washington Island	City Hall	Community Center	Electric Department	Fire Station #1	Fire Station #3	Fire Station #4	Library/Arts Center	Naval Reserve/Pool Area	Orchard Area	2224 W. 6th	West Park	GRAND TOTAL
Alpha Source LLC dba Land Run Lawn Care, Stillwater, OK	1,120.00	1,120.00	2,240.00	2,240.00	2,240.00	2,240.00	2,240.00	6,720.00	2,240.00	4,480.00	4,480.00	6,720.00	11,200.00	2,240.00	2,240.00	5,600.00	11,200.00	6,720.00	1,280.00	1,280.00	\$79,840.00
Lawn & Order Lawn Care LLC, Woodward, OK	3,104.16	1,678.24	1,031.04	1,259.84	2,936.00	743.68	962.24	4,525.76	5,722.56	3,253.44	2,167.36	8,938.24	23,120.96	2,687.36	1,918.08	7,197.12	15,170.88	8,232.00	1,204.16	1,198.72	\$97,051.84
U.S. Lawns of Stillwater, Stillwater, OK	1,680.00	1,600.00	2,400.00	2,400.00	5,440.00	2,080.00	2,080.00	6,400.00	3,840.00	8,000.00	5,760.00	6,560.00	8,640.00	2,880.00	2,720.00	7,520.00	9,440.00	6,240.00	2,080.00	2,080.00	\$89,840.00
*CNG Solutions LLC, Edmond, OK	3,608.00	2,165.00	2,400.00	2,400.00	4,618.00	960.00	2,400.00	NO BID	5,773.00	4,618.00	5,773.00	NO BID	16,164.00	5,773.00	4,618.00	10,391.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3,464.00	\$75,125.00
* Alternate Consideration: If all bid items are accepted, a five percent (5%) discount can be applied to each of the unit prices and total prices above.																					
The Landscape Partners, Yukon, OK	1,060.00	1,040.00	2,080.00	2,080.00	2,800.00	2,080.00	2,080.00	3,915.00	2,575.00	3,865.00	3,000.00	4,495.00	9,215.00	2,080.00	2,080.00	5,730.00	10,085.00	4,256.00	2,080.00	2,080.00	\$68,676.00
Shann's Lawn & Landscape LLC, Stillwater, OK	1,400.00	1,236.00	1,977.60	2,636.80	2,801.60	2,801.60	1,648.00	8,404.80	4,120.00	6,097.60	4,779.20	9,064.00	13,019.20	2,801.60	3,131.20	11,371.20	13,019.20	9,888.00	3,131.20	2,142.40	\$105,471.20

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, JIM SCOTT

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.